

BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:
LJA JOB NO.

CONSTRUCTION OF THE BACKUP SLUICE GATES FOR GREATWOOD PUMP STATIONS 1 AND 2
TO SERVE FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 11
CITY OF GREATWOOD
FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
JANUARY 30, 2018
LJA ENGINEERING, INC.
P.CHATTERJEE
JANUARY 30, 2018
2010-1701/2 (9.2)

BIDDER'S NAME	TOTAL BID AMOUNT	TOTAL BID INCL. ALTERNATE
1) NBG CONSTRUCTORS, INC.	\$1,679,000.00	\$1,455,000.00
2) T & C CONSTRUCTION, LTD.	\$1,838,750.00 *	\$1,698,750.00 *
3) FUSED INDUSTRIES, LLC	\$1,855,220.43	\$1,740,323.43
4) JERDON ENTERPRISE, L.P.	\$1,986,000.00	\$1,855,000.00
5) B-5 CONSTRUCTION, CO., INC.	\$2,032,499.00	\$2,263,196.00 *
6) PELTIER BROS. CONST., LTD. BY: PB, LLC	\$2,454,735.00	\$2,454,735.00

CALENDAR DAYS - 300/330



Michael S. Rusk

I, Michael S. Rusk, P.E., hereby certify these bid tabulations to be true and correct.

Michael S. Rusk
2/1/18

BID TABULATION FOR:

CONSTRUCTION OF THE BACKUP SLUICE GATES FOR GREATWOOD PUMP STATIONS 1 AND 2
 TO SERVE FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 11
 CITY OF GREATWOOD
 FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 LJA ENGINEERING, INC.
 P.CHATTERJEE
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 2010-1701/2 (9.2)

BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:
LJA JOB NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	1) NBG CONSTRUCTORS, INC.		2) T & C CONSTRUCTION, LTD.		3) FUSED INDUSTRIES, LLC		
			UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	
GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1									
1. SITE WORK INCLUDING ACCESS TO SITE, DIRTWORK, GRADING, SEEDING, HYDROMULCH OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, SURFACE DRAINAGE, FENCING, TEMPORARY COFFER DAMS, BYPASS PUMPS, DESILTING, DEMOLITION, SWPPP ETC., AS NECESSARY TO CONSTRUCT FACILITIES AS SHOWN ON CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$80,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$82,500.00	\$82,500.00	
2. 3 - 136 IN. X 144 IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES BY RODNEY HUNT COMPANY (MODEL # SG - R-3454X3648-C1-FWM-E2) OR APPROVED EQUAL DESIGNED, WHEN INSTALLED PROPERLY, TO SAFELY WITHSTAND 17 FT. OF SEATING HEAD AND 26 FT. OF UNSEATING HEAD INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, CONNECTORS, BOLTS, FRAMES, ANY, TEMPLATE, ETC., FOR SLUICE GATE INSTALLATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$500,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$460,000.00	\$460,000.00	\$387,069.00	\$387,069.00	
3. INSTALLATION OF 3-136 IN. X 144 IN., CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES, TO INCLUDE ALL LABOR, CONCRETE WORK, NON-SHRINK GROUT, BACKFILL, MODIFICATION TO EXISTING HANDRAIL, INSTALLATION OF NEW HANDRAIL, REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING CONCRETE CHANNEL AND TOE, AND CONSTRUCTION OF NEW CONCRETE CULVERTS AND HEADWALL STRUCTURE, AS SHOWN IN THE CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$220,000.00	\$220,000.00	\$370,000.00	\$370,000.00	\$454,669.00	\$454,669.00	
4. ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS, (BY ROTORK IQ FOR OPEN /CLOSE SERVICE FOR 3-136" X 144" CAST IRON SLUICE GATE OR APPROVED EQUAL), INCLUDES OPERATING STEMS AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$127,912.00	\$127,912.00	
5. INSTALLATION OF ALL ELECTRICAL, INCLUDING, LABOR, CONDUIT, WIRING, ENCLOSURES, CIRCUIT BREAKERS, DISCONNECT SWITCHES, ALL CONDUIT AND ENCLOSURE SUPPORTS, EXTENDABLE SO CABLING WITH A COORDINATED RECEPTACLE TO PLUG INTO AN EXISTING PORTABLE GENERATOR, WIRE TESTING, GROUNDING SYSTEM TESTING, AND ALL OTHER RELATED APPURTENANCES AND CONSTRUCTION SO AS TO PROVIDE A COMPLETE IN PLACE INSTALLATION PER THE CONSTRUCTION PLAN & BID DOCUMENTS	LS	1	\$47,000.00	\$47,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$61,362.00	\$61,362.00	
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1				\$947,000.00		\$1,020,000.00		\$1,113,512.00	
GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2									
1. SITE WORK INCLUDING ACCESS TO SITE, DIRTWORK, GRADING, SEEDING, HYDROMULCH OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, SURFACE DRAINAGE, FENCING, TEMPORARY COFFER DAMS, BYPASS PUMPS, DESILTING, DEMOLITION, SWPPP ITEMS, ETC., AS NECESSARY TO CONSTRUCT FACILITIES AS SHOWN ON CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$9,698.00	\$9,698.00	
2. 3 - 108-IN. X 120-IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES BY RODNEY HUNT COMPANY (MODEL # SG - S/2743X3048 - C1 - FWM - E2 - UFC) OR APPROVED EQUAL DESIGNED, WHEN INSTALLED PROPERLY, TO SAFELY WITHSTAND 17 FT. OF SEATING HEAD AND 27 FT. OF UNSEATING HEAD INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, CONNECTORS, BOLTS, FRAMES, ANY TEMPLATE, ETC. FOR SLUICE GATE INSTALLATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$350,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$420,000.00	\$415,807.43	\$415,807.43	
3. INSTALLATION OF 3 - 108-IN. X 120-IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES TO INCLUDE ALL CONCRETE WORK, NON-SHRINK GROUT, BACKFILL, MODIFICATION TO EXISTING HANDRAIL, INSTALLATION OF NEW HANDRAIL, THREE CONCRETE PADS, AND STEEL WALKWAY, AS SHOWN IN THE CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$132,000.00	\$132,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$113,169.00	\$113,169.00	
4. ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS, (BY ROTORK IQ FOR OPEN /CLOSE SERVICE FOR 3-108" X 120" CAST IRON SLUICE GATE OR APPROVED EQUAL), INCLUDES OPERATING STEMS AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$91,972.00	\$91,972.00	

BID TABULATION FOR:

CONSTRUCTION OF THE BACKUP SLUICE GATES FOR GREATWOOD PUMP STATIONS 1 AND 2
 TO SERVE FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 11
 CITY OF GREATWOOD
 FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 LJA ENGINEERING, INC.
 P.CHATTERJEE
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 2010-1701/2 (9.2)

BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:
LJA JOB NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	1) NBG CONSTRUCTORS, INC.		2) T & C CONSTRUCTION, LTD.		3) FUSED INDUSTRIES, LLC	
			UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
5. INSTALLATION OF ALL ELECTRICAL, INCLUDING LABOR, CONDUIT, WIRING, ENCLOSURES, CIRCUIT BREAKERS, DISCONNECT SWITCHES, ALL CONDUIT AND ENCLOSURE SUPPORTS, EXTENDABLE SO CABLING WITH A COORDINATED RECEPTACLE TO PLUG INTO AN EXISTING PORTABLE GENERATOR, WIRE TESTING, GROUNDING SYSTEM TESTING, AND ALL OTHER RELATED APPURTENANCES, AND CONSTRUCTION TO PROVIDE A COMPLETE IN PLACE INSTALLATION PER THE CONSTRUCTION PLAN, AND BID PROPOSAL, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$62,562.00	\$62,562.00
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2 ITEMS				\$692,000.00	\$750,000.00		\$693,208.43	
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS								
1. EXTRA CEMENT STABILIZED SAND, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	500	\$25.00	\$12,500.00	\$25.00	\$12,500.00	\$25.00	\$12,500.00
2. EXTRA STRUCTURAL REINFORCED CONCRETE, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	20	\$500.00	\$10,000.00	\$500.00	\$10,000.00	\$500.00	\$10,000.00
3. CRUSHED STONE FOR ACCESS ROAD POINT REPAIRS, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	1,000	\$12.00	\$12,000.00	\$30.00	\$30,000.00	\$12.00	\$12,000.00
4. REMOVE & REPLACE EX. CHAIN LINK FENCE AS MAY BE NEEDED FOR CONSTRUCTION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LF	500	\$10.00	\$5,000.00	\$30.00	\$15,000.00	\$25.00	\$12,500.00
5. STANDARD DEDUCT FOR STREET CLEANING, (AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	HR	0	(\$150.00)	\$0.00	(\$150.00)	\$0.00	(\$150.00)	\$0.00
6. REINFORCED FILTER FABRIC FENCING, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LF	250	\$2.00	\$500.00	\$5.00	\$1,250.00	\$6.00	\$1,500.00
SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS				\$40,000.00	\$68,750.00		\$48,500.00	
ALTERNATE ITEMS								
1. DEDUCT FOR DELETING 3 ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOXES AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	(\$136,000.00)	(\$136,000.00)	(\$130,000.00)	(\$130,000.00)	(\$88,923.00)	(\$88,923.00)
2. ADD THREE MANUAL GEAR BOXES SIZED TO ACCOMMODATE FUTURE ELECTRICAL ACTUATORS IN LIEU OF MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOX COMBO AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$19,500.00	\$19,500.00
3. DEDUCT FOR DELETING 3 ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOXES AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	(\$136,000.00)	(\$136,000.00)	(\$130,000.00)	(\$130,000.00)	(\$64,974.00)	(\$64,974.00)
4. ADD THREE MANUAL GEAR BOXES SIZED TO ACCOMMODATE FUTURE ELECTRICAL ACTUATORS IN LIEU OF MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOX COMBO AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$19,500.00	\$19,500.00
SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE ITEMS				(\$224,000.00)	(\$140,000.00)		(\$114,897.00)	
BID SUMMARY								
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1				\$947,000.00	\$1,020,000.00		\$1,113,512.00	
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2 ITEMS				\$692,000.00	\$750,000.00		\$693,208.43	
SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS				\$40,000.00	\$68,750.00		\$48,500.00	
TOTAL AMOUNT BID				\$1,679,000.00	\$1,838,750.00		\$1,855,220.43	
SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE ITEMS				(\$224,000.00)	(\$140,000.00)		(\$114,897.00)	
TOTAL AMOUNT BID INCLUDING ALTERNATE BID				\$1,455,000.00	\$1,698,750.00		\$1,740,323.43	

BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:
LJA JOB NO.

CONSTRUCTION OF THE BACKUP SLUICE GATES FOR GREATWOOD PUMP STATIONS 1 AND 2
 TO SERVE FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 11
 CITY OF GREATWOOD
 FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 LJA ENGINEERING, INC.
 P.CHATTERJEE
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 2010-1701/2 (9.2)

ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	4) JERDON ENTERPRISE, L.P.		5) B-5 CONSTRUCTION, CO., INC.		6) PELTIER BROS. CONST., LTD. BY: PB, LLC	
			UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1								
1. SITE WORK INCLUDING ACCESS TO SITE, DIRTWORK, GRADING, SEEDING, HYDROMULCH OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, SURFACE DRAINAGE, FENCING, TEMPORARY COFFER DAMS, BYPASS PUMPS, DESILTING, DEMOLITION, SWPPP ETC., AS NECESSARY TO CONSTRUCT FACILITIES AS SHOWN ON CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$65,000.00	\$65,000.00	\$16,161.00	\$16,161.00	\$445,172.00	\$445,172.00
2. 3 - 136 IN. X 144 IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES BY RODNEY HUNT COMPANY (MODEL # SG - R-3454X3648-C1-FWM-E2) OR APPROVED EQUAL DESIGNED, WHEN INSTALLED PROPERLY, TO SAFELY WITHSTAND 17 FT. OF SEATING HEAD AND 26 FT. OF UNSEATING HEAD INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, CONNECTORS, BOLTS, FRAMES, ANY, TEMPLATE, ETC., FOR SLUICE GATE INSTALLATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$483,000.00	\$483,000.00	\$616,646.00	\$616,646.00	\$495,000.00	\$495,000.00
3. INSTALLATION OF 3-136 IN. X 144 IN., CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES, TO INCLUDE ALL LABOR, CONCRETE WORK, NON-SHRINK GROUT, BACKFILL, MODIFICATION TO EXISTING HANDRAIL, INSTALLATION OF NEW HANDRAIL, REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING CONCRETE CHANNEL AND TOE, AND CONSTRUCTION OF NEW CONCRETE CULVERTS AND HEADWALL STRUCTURE, AS SHOWN IN THE CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$378,000.00	\$378,000.00	\$356,916.00	\$356,916.00	\$311,782.00	\$311,782.00
4. ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS, (BY ROTORK IQ FOR OPEN /CLOSE SERVICE FOR 3-136" X 144" CAST IRON SLUICE GATE OR APPROVED EQUAL), INCLUDES OPERATING STEMS AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$118,000.00	\$118,000.00	\$136,418.00	\$136,418.00	\$110,000.00	\$110,000.00
5. INSTALLATION OF ALL ELECTRICAL, INCLUDING, LABOR, CONDUIT, WIRING, ENCLOSURES, CIRCUIT BREAKERS, DISCONNECT SWITCHES, ALL CONDUIT AND ENCLOSURE SUPPORTS, EXTENDABLE SO CABLING WITH A COORDINATED RECEPTACLE TO PLUG INTO AN EXISTING PORTABLE GENERATOR, WIRE TESTING, GROUNDING SYSTEM TESTING, AND ALL OTHER RELATED APPURTENANCES AND CONSTRUCTION SO AS TO PROVIDE A COMPLETE IN PLACE INSTALLATION PER THE CONSTRUCTION PLAN & BID DOCUMENTS	LS	1	\$56,000.00	\$56,000.00	\$52,038.00	\$52,038.00	\$49,500.00	\$49,500.00
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1				\$1,100,000.00		\$1,178,179.00		\$1,411,454.00
GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2								
1. SITE WORK INCLUDING ACCESS TO SITE, DIRTWORK, GRADING, SEEDING, HYDROMULCH OF ALL DISTURBED AREAS, SURFACE DRAINAGE, FENCING, TEMPORARY COFFER DAMS, BYPASS PUMPS, DESILTING, DEMOLITION, SWPPP ITEMS, ETC., AS NECESSARY TO CONSTRUCT FACILITIES AS SHOWN ON CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$18,392.00	\$18,392.00	\$157,049.00	\$157,049.00
2. 3 - 108-IN. X 120-IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES BY RODNEY HUNT COMPANY (MODEL # SG - S/2743X3048 - C1 - FWM - E2 - UFC) OR APPROVED EQUAL DESIGNED, WHEN INSTALLED PROPERLY, TO SAFELY WITHSTAND 17 FT. OF SEATING HEAD AND 27 FT. OF UNSEATING HEAD INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, CONNECTORS, BOLTS, FRAMES, ANY TEMPLATE, ETC. FOR SLUICE GATE INSTALLATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$483,000.00	\$483,000.00	\$432,260.00	\$432,260.00	\$386,100.00	\$386,100.00
3. INSTALLATION OF 3 - 108-IN. X 120-IN. CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED SLUICE GATES TO INCLUDE ALL CONCRETE WORK, NON-SHRINK GROUT, BACKFILL, MODIFICATION TO EXISTING HANDRAIL, INSTALLATION OF NEW HANDRAIL, THREE CONCRETE PADS, AND STEEL WALKWAY, AS SHOWN IN THE CONSTRUCTION PLANS, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$192,624.00	\$192,624.00	\$311,782.00	\$311,782.00
4. ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS, (BY ROTORK IQ FOR OPEN /CLOSE SERVICE FOR 3-108" X 120" CAST IRON SLUICE GATE OR APPROVED EQUAL), INCLUDES OPERATING STEMS AND ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$90,000.00	\$90,000.00	\$107,269.00	\$107,269.00	\$88,000.00	\$88,000.00

BID TABULATION FOR:

BID OPENING DATE:
BID OPENING LOCATION:
TABULATION BY:
TABULATION DATE:
LJA JOB NO.

CONSTRUCTION OF THE BACKUP SLUICE GATES FOR GREATWOOD PUMP STATIONS 1 AND 2
 TO SERVE FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 11
 CITY OF GREATWOOD
 FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 LJA ENGINEERING, INC.
 P.CHATTERJEE
 JANUARY 30, 2018
 2010-1701/2 (9.2)

ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	4) JERDON ENTERPRISE, L.P.		5) B-S CONSTRUCTION, CO., INC.		6) PELTIER BROS. CONST., LTD. BY: PB, LLC		
			UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	
5. INSTALLATION OF ALL ELECTRICAL, INCLUDING LABOR, CONDUIT, WIRING, ENCLOSURES, CIRCUIT BREAKERS, DISCONNECT SWITCHES, ALL CONDUIT AND ENCLOSURE SUPPORTS, EXTENDABLE SO CABLING WITH A COORDINATED RECEPTACLE TO PLUG INTO AN EXISTING PORTABLE GENERATOR, WIRE TESTING, GROUNDING SYSTEM TESTING, AND ALL OTHER RELATED APPURTENANCES, AND CONSTRUCTION TO PROVIDE A COMPLETE IN PLACE INSTALLATION PER THE CONSTRUCTION PLAN, AND BID PROPOSAL, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$58,000.00	\$58,000.00	\$50,025.00	\$50,025.00	\$50,600.00	\$50,600.00	
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2 ITEMS				\$841,000.00		\$800,570.00		\$993,531.00	
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS									
1. EXTRA CEMENT STABILIZED SAND, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	500	\$25.00	\$12,500.00	\$30.00	\$15,000.00	\$25.00	\$12,500.00	
2. EXTRA STRUCTURAL REINFORCED CONCRETE, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	20	\$500.00	\$10,000.00	\$500.00	\$10,000.00	\$500.00	\$10,000.00	
3. CRUSHED STONE FOR ACCESS ROAD POINT REPAIRS, (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	CY	1,000	\$12.00	\$12,000.00	\$12.00	\$12,000.00	\$12.00	\$12,000.00	
4. REMOVE & REPLACE EX. CHAIN LINK FENCE AS MAY BE NEEDED FOR CONSTRUCTION, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LF	500	\$20.00	\$10,000.00	\$32.00	\$16,000.00	\$29.00	\$14,500.00	
5. STANDARD DEDUCT FOR STREET CLEANING, (AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE	HR	0	(\$150.00)	\$0.00	(\$150.00)	\$0.00	(\$150.00)	\$0.00	
6. REINFORCED FILTER FABRIC FENCING, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LF	250	\$2.00	\$500.00	\$3.00	\$750.00	\$3.00	\$750.00	
SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS				\$45,000.00		\$53,750.00		\$49,750.00	
ALTERNATE ITEMS									
1. DEDUCT FOR DELETING 3 ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOXES AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	(\$100,000.00)	(\$100,000.00)	\$88,923.00	\$88,923.00	NO BID	NO BID	
2. ADD THREE MANUAL GEAR BOXES SIZED TO ACCOMMODATE FUTURE ELECTRICAL ACTUATORS IN LIEU OF MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOX COMBO AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$23,000.00	\$23,000.00	\$38,400.00	\$38,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	
3. DEDUCT FOR DELETING 3 ELECTRICAL MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOXES AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	(\$77,000.00)	(\$77,000.00)	\$64,974.00	\$64,974.00	NO BID	NO BID	
4. ADD THREE MANUAL GEAR BOXES SIZED TO ACCOMMODATE FUTURE ELECTRICAL ACTUATORS IN LIEU OF MOTORIZED ACTUATORS AND GEAR BOX COMBO AT GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2, COMPLETE IN PLACE	LS	1	\$23,000.00	\$23,000.00	\$38,400.00	\$38,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	
SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE ITEMS				(\$131,000.00)		\$230,697.00		\$0.00	
BID SUMMARY									
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 1				\$1,100,000.00		\$1,178,179.00		\$1,411,454.00	
SUBTOTAL GREATWOOD PUMP STATION NO. 2 ITEMS				\$841,000.00		\$800,570.00		\$993,531.00	
SUBTOTAL MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS				\$45,000.00		\$53,750.00		\$49,750.00	
TOTAL AMOUNT BID				\$1,986,000.00		\$2,032,499.00		\$2,454,735.00	
SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE ITEMS				(\$131,000.00)		\$230,697.00		\$0.00	
TOTAL AMOUNT BID INCLUDING ALTERNATE BID				\$1,855,000.00		\$2,263,196.00		\$2,454,735.00	