

BID TABULATION FOR:

CONSTRUCTION OF BACKUP SLUICE GATE PURCHASE PACKAGE  
FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 10  
CITY OF SUGAR LAND, FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE:  
BID OPENING LOCATION:  
TABULATION BY:  
TABULATION DATE:  
LJA JOB NO.

OCTOBER 7, 2020  
LJA ENGINEERING, INC.  
D. FORREST  
OCTOBER 7, 2020  
2569-2003 (9.2)

BIDDER'S NAME	TOTAL AMOUNT BID	BID INCLUDING ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES)
1) RODNEY HUNT INC.	\$66,900.00	\$148,500.00
2) HENRY PRATT COMPANY, LLC. FKA HYDRO GATE	\$86,004.00	NO BID
3) ISE METAL INC.	\$93,406.00	NO BID



*C. W. Kalkomey* 10/19/2020

I, Craig W. Kalkomey, P.E., hereby certify these bid tabulations to be true and correct.

**BID TABULATION FOR:**

**BID OPENING DATE:**  
**BID OPENING LOCATION:**  
**TABULATION BY:**  
**TABULATION DATE:**  
**LJA JOB NO.**

CONSTRUCTION OF BACKUP SLUICE GATE PURCHASE PACKAGE  
 FORT BEND COUNTY LEVEE IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT NO. 10  
 CITY OF SUGAR LAND, FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS  
 OCTOBER 7, 2020  
 LJA ENGINEERING, INC.  
 D. FORREST  
 OCTOBER 7, 2020  
 2569-2003 (9.2)

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	QTY	1) RODNEY HUNT INC.		ENRY PRATT COMPANY, LLC. FKA HYDRO G		3) ISE METAL INC.	
				UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
<b>SLIDE GATE ITEMS</b>									
1	8'X8' CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED STAINLESS STEEL SLIDE GATE INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, FRAMES, STEM, ELECTRIC ACTUATORS, AND ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES FOR THE FUTURE INSTALLATION OF THE GATES. GATES SHOULD SAFELY WITHSTAND AT LEAST 30 FEET OF SEATING AND UNSETTING HEAD	EA	2	\$28,650.00	\$57,300.00	\$41,772.00	\$83,544.00	\$42,275.00	\$84,550.00
2	DELIVERY OF GATES, INCLUDING SHIPPING AND OFF LOAD HANDLING OF GATES, TO THE FORT BEND COUNTY LID 10 PUMP STATION, LOCATED BEHIND THE PARK OFF OF CRANBROOK RIDGE LANE	EA	2	\$4,800.00	\$9,600.00	\$1,230.00	\$2,460.00	\$4,428.00	\$8,856.00
<b>SLIDE GATE ITEMS SUBTOTAL:</b>					<b>\$66,900.00</b>	<b>\$86,004.00</b>			<b>\$93,406.00</b>
<b>ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES)</b>									
1	8'X8' CENTER COLUMN SELF-CONTAINED CAST IRON SLIDE GATE INCLUDING WALL THIMBLES, FRAMES, STEM, ELECTRIC ACTUATORS, AND ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES FOR THE FUTURE INSTALLATION OF THE GATES. GATES SHOULD SAFELY WITHSTAND AT LEAST 30 FEET OF SEATING AND UNSETTING HEAD. TO BE USED IN LIEU OF SLIDE GATE ITEM NO. 1	EA	2	\$67,700.00	\$135,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	DELIVERY OF GATES, INCLUDING SHIPPING AND OFF LOAD HANDLING OF GATES, TO THE FORT BEND COUNTY LID 10 PUMP STATION, LOCATED BEHIND THE PARK OFF OF CRANBROOK RIDGE LANE. TO BE USED IN LIEU OF SLIDE GATE ITEM NO. 2	EA	2	\$6,550.00	\$13,100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES) SUBTOTAL:</b>					<b>\$148,500.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
<b>BIDDING SUMMARY</b>									
SUBTOTAL SLIDE GATE ITEMS					\$66,900.00	\$86,004.00			\$93,406.00
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID</b>					<b>\$66,900.00</b>	<b>\$86,004.00</b>			<b>\$93,406.00</b>
<b>ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES)</b>									
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID					\$66,900.00	\$86,004.00			\$93,406.00
DEDUCT SLIDE GATE ITEMS ITEM NO.1					-\$57,300.00	-\$83,544.00			-\$84,550.00
DEDUCT SLIDE GATE ITEMS ITEM NO.2					-\$9,600.00	-\$2,460.00			-\$8,856.00
SUBTOTAL ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES)					\$148,500.00	NO BID			NO BID
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT INCLUDING ALTERNATIVE SLIDE GATE ITEMS (CAST IRON GATES)</b>					<b>\$148,500.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>